
Dear parents, carers and children, 

We are very proud of our Y6 children who had their KS2 SATs this week. They all worked incredibly hard over the four days, showing dili-

gence, perseverance, resilience and a ‘can-do’ attitude. Well done! Thank you to the rest of the school for being so understanding and walk-

ing quietly around the building during specific times. 

We are all looking forward to Wolverton Folk and Blues Festival tomorrow. This is a fun-filled day with lots of fabulous music and 

activities. The BSA are running a tea tent and children’s craft tent; thank you to everyone who has volunteered to help out with 

these. Please call in at the office or let a member of the BSA know if you are able to help. Money raised from the day is shared 

between Leukaemia Research and Brighstone Primary School, which is fantastic. Looking forward to seeing you there! 

The BSA held a pre-loved uniform sale after school on Monday 9th May in the playground. They raised a fabulous £35; all pro-

ceeds go towards the school to help with trips and resources. These sales will be held every 3rd Monday of each term. 

Koala class have been very creative this week! They have been reading the inspirational books The Dot and 

Ish by Peter H. Reynolds, which remind us that it's good to express ourselves and not worry about making mistakes. This 

week the Year 1s have been exploring how Monet painted. He was the founder of the Impressionist movement and the 

children noticed how he didn't paint things precisely, but thought about the light and colours. They have used paint, 

mixing the primary colours, and adding black or white to change the shade, to create their paintings of Monet's bridge.  

We are pleased to be able to share the following key dates with you: 

 Thursday 26th May: Jubilee Day celebrations 

 Monday 6th June: Staff development day (children return to school on Tuesday 7th June after the half term holiday) 

 Wednesday 15th June: Reception and KS1 Messy Church (more details to follow soon) 

 Wednesday 22nd June: Y6 Leavers’ Service at Portsmouth Cathedral (more details to follow soon) 

 Monday 27th - Wednesday 29th June: Y4 residential at Kingswood 

 Thursday 30th June: Class photos 

 Friday 1st July: Sports Day (contingency date Monday 4th July) 

 Friday 1st July: Reports go home 

 Tuesday 5th July: Parents Evening 

 Monday 18th July: Summer Concert (more details to follow soon) 
 

I hope you all have fantastic weekend, and I look forward to seeing you at Wolverton if you can make it. 

Best wishes, Mrs Lennon and the Brighstone team 

Learning and Achieving Through  

Love, Courage and Respect 

This week’s Collective Worship focus is: Service—Giving with no 

strings attached 
 

This week in Collective Worship, we watched some children perform a 

short drama in which Rosie made some muesli bars to give to her 

friends. They wondered if they had to buy them, or do something for 

her in return, but she was just doing it out of the goodness of her 

heart, with no strings attached. 

 

 

Prayer of St. Augustine 

Eternal God, 

You are… 

The light of minds that know you 

The joy of hearts that love you 

And the strength of the wills that serve you. 

Help us so to know you 

That we may truly love you, 

And so to love you that 

We may fully serve you 

Through Jesus Christ our Lord, 

Amen 

 

“I did not come to be served, but to serve.” 

Matthew 20.28 



School Dinners 
Children in Year R, 1 and 2 are entitled to a ‘universal’ free school meal everyday.  

Children in Years 3-6 are charged at £2.15 per day.  

Whole school dates 

See p1 of the Buzz 

 

Reminders 
Check our FACEBOOK page for updates!  

https://www.facebook.com/BrighstoneCEPrimarySchool 
All long hair should be tied back in school colours. 

 

The one-way system is still in operation in the mornings.  

 
 

 

   Poetry Corner 
 
 

 

Grammar and Spelling Matters 
Each week we will include a mini grammar or spelling lesson so 

you know what your children are learning! 
 

Figures of Speech—Alliteration 
 

 

Attendance Matters! 
 

Week Commencing 9th May 
Whole School attendance target: 96.5% 

 

       Actual Attendance: 94.7%  
Late marks this week: 2 

Let’s improve attendance next week! 

Koala Georgia - for her all round motivation and excitement to learn. Skye - for her good focus and participation in Read 

Write Inc. Sam - for slowing down and working really carefully. 

Polar Bear Charlotte - for working more independently in English and Maths, and for showing so much creativity in art and design. 

Lemur Jared, Toby and Fraser - for showing maturity and friendship qualities. 

Y3 swimmers - for making good progress in swimming lessons. 

Chimpanzee Erin - for overall effort in all lessons and thoughtful and considered contributions to class discussions. 

Orangutan Katherine - for the determination and perseverance she has put into her Maths revision for SATs. Y6 swimmers - for 

making good progress in swimming lessons. 

Bee-Haviour Leo - for showing the school values. 

Sports Bee Evan - for fantastic focus, behaviour and batting skills during PE. 

HT’s award Connie - for her contributions and supportive work with mental health charities. 

Monday Tuesday Wednesday Thursday Friday Week 2 

Pizza Sausage and Mash Roast Turkey Lasagne Fish Fingers Option 1 

Veggie Bolognese Chickpea and   Quorn Roast Veggie Lasagne Veggie Burger Option 2 

Dessert Flapjack Shortbread Yoghurt Cake Chocolate Brownie Ice Cream 

Can you make up some 

alliterative sentences? 

Can you spot the       

alliterative phrases? 

https://www.facebook.com/BrighstoneCEPrimarySchool


Social, Emotional & Mental Health 

Let’s talk about mental 
health! This week is mental 
health awareness week. Isn’t 
it sad that we have to have an 
awareness week for some-
thing that is so prevalent. The 
trouble is that there is still a 
stigma attached to mental 
health and some people feel 
uncomfortable discussing it. 
The way we combat this is by 
talking about it more often, 
with everyone! 
 

Our mental health is not a 
fixed state, it can change    
daily, weekly, monthly, but it’s 
important to know when to 
practise self-care and when to 
seek professional advice. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Further information: 

https://www.mentalhealth.org.uk 

https://www.mentalhealth.org.uk/


 

 

 

 

 

Koala Class 

Koala Class have been reading the inspirational books The Dot and Ish by Peter H. Reynolds, which remind us that it's good to 

express ourselves and not worry about making mistakes.  

 

 

 

 

 

 

This week the Year 1s have been exploring how Monet painted. He was the founder of the Impressionist movement and the 

children noticed how he didn't paint things precisely, but thought about the light and colours. They have used paint, mixing the 

primary colours, and adding black or white to change the shade, to create their paintings of Monet's bridge. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



 

 

 

 

 

Lemur and Chimpanzee Classes 

This week, Years 3, 4 and 5 had a workshop from the Island Heritage 

Education Service, focusing on the Ancient Egyptians and mummifi-

cation. They learned all about the process of mummification and the 

beliefs that the Ancient Egyptians had. The main goal for an Ancient 

Egyptian after they died was for the body to make it through to the 

afterlife, but, in order to successfully make it through, they had to 

pass a number of hurdles. It was extremely interesting and even involved a real mummified hand! 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



Who are Brighstone School Association (The BSA)? 

We are simply a group of parents and teachers working in partnership to raise much needed funds for our children. We meet about 

once  every half term. Most of us have full time jobs and other commitments as well as our own  families. 

Chair - Katherine Harrison; Vice Chair - Franki Barker;  

Treasurer - Sarah       Cartmell; Secretary - Kate Cambridge 

What do we do? 

We explore fundraising ideas such as cake sales, mufti, bingo, community events, school discos and Mothers’ Day shop, to name a 

few.  

One of our biggest fundraisers is Wolverton Folk and Blues Festival and we desperately need volunteers throughout the day! 

We then use this money to support your children's education and  enjoyment, such as paying towards trips, buying Easter and Christ-

mas gifts, and donating towards equipment such as a new trim trail for the playground (coming soon). 

How much do we need to raise each year? 

On average we need to raise about £5k every year! 

How can you help? 

Join us: you are already a member as your child goes to our school! You can attend meetings and share your ideas too! 

Support us: volunteer to help at events, bake cakes for cake sales. If every parent helped at one event every year it would make an 

incredible difference! 

Promote our events: Attend events and share via social media and word of 

mouth.  Join us on Facebook and Instagram!!  

To be confirmed 












